
 
 

 

 

 

 
 

Delta 26 Open  >  SE-DTA26023D313 

Price SEK1,150,000 EU VAT paid 

Location Stockholm, Sweden 

 

Year 2013 

LOA 24’7” / 7.5m 

Beam 8’6” / 2.6m 

Draft 2’11” / 0.9m 

Displacement 2,100kg / 4,630lb 

Hull Material GRP 

Engine 1 x Volvo Penta D3-220A-G, 220hp 

Builder Luksusjaht AS, Sweden 

Designer Ted Mannerfelt 

Accommodation 2 berths in 1 cabin 

SCAN TO VIEW 
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BROKER’S COMMENTS 
 
Delta boats have long been renowned for their high-end craftsmanship and exceptional quality, 
featuring a range of fiberglass and carbon-fiber vessels spanning from 7.5 to 26 meters in length.  
They proudly proclaim themselves as "Scandinavia’s fastest-growing motorboat brand." 
 
Delta Powerboats, founded by a Swedish team, draw inspiration from the rich heritage of 
Scandinavian yacht design. Their range has evolved to encompass agile day cruisers, versatile hardtop 
cabin cruisers, and luxury performance yachts crafted from lightweight carbon fiber. 
 
The Delta 26 Open is one of their smallest gems, ideally suited for day cruising or serving as a 
luxurious mega-yacht tender. This versatile vessel can accommodate up to six passengers comfortably 
in its comfortable seating arrangements of three sofas. It elegantly combines modernity with classic 
runabout elegance and offers the perfect choice for weekend getaways. 
 
Designed by the illustrious Ted Mannerfelt, the Delta 26 Open boasts a twin-stepped, air-supported, 
deep-v hull, ensuring remarkable fuel efficiency and stability, even at high speeds. Delta boats are 
famed for their good hydrodynamics, unwavering seaworthiness, and user-friendly design crafted to 
the highest standards. 
 
Navigating the Delta 26 Open is effortless, with generous deck areas facilitating safe passage from the 
stern to the bow, all while maximizing interior space. Innovative solutions on board cater to both the 
novice and seasoned yachtsmen. Below deck, you'll find a comfortable forecabin with berths for two 
and a separate head. 
 
This 2013 Delta 26 Open has seen minimal use over the years, resulting in low engine hours. She´s 
well-maintained and stored indoors during the winter months. Her Volvo Penta D3 Diesel engine is 
known for its safety, reliability, low noise levels and fuel efficiency.  
 
What sets this offering apart is the inclusion of a trailer, making it completely turnkey and ready for 
adventure. With the freedom to explore new horizons, this boat has the potential to create 
unforgettable memories. 
 
In a world where some compromise quality for profit, Delta remains committed to their tradition of 
unwavering quality. Each Delta Powerboat is a testament to the skill of experienced boat builders, 
blending traditional craftsmanship with cutting-edge technology. 
 
Explore more photos here: https://berthonscandinavia.se/en/yachts-for-sale/delta-26-open-
dta26023D313/ 
 
Key Facts: 

 Diesel engine with low hours. 

 Bowthruster. 

 Windlass. 

 New plotter – 2023. 

 Waterboiler. 

 Fuel efficient. 

 Madresses and cushions in good condition.  

 Underwater LED light. 

 Boat trailer. 
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CONSTRUCTION 
 
RCD Status: The yacht conforms with the essential safety requirements of Directive 94/25EC or RCDII  
(2013/53/EU as appropriate (Recreational Craft Directive) and is categorised C – Coastal (8 People). 
 
Hull, Deck & Superstructure Construction: 

 White hull with black rubbing strake. 

 Twin stepped air-supported deep V-hull. 

 Vacuum infused vinylester. 

 Divinycell core. 

 Carbon fiber reinforced stringers. 

 Hand laid teak in cockpit decks and stairs. 

 Custom-made Stainless steel fittings. 

 1 x skylight. 

 Large bathing platform. 

 Foldable bathing ladder at transom. 

 Environmental antifouling (prop, stern and outdrive). 
 

MACHINERY 
 
Engine & Gearboxes: 

 1 x Volvo Penta D3-220A-G, 220hp (224hrs by autumn 2023). 

 Throttle controls for outdrives (Volvo Penta). 

 Volvo Pentas Electronic engine control platform (EVC). 
 
Maintenance & Performance: 

 Engines & drives serviced by SAL Volvo main dealer – 2022. 

 Anodes & antifouling autumn – 2023. 

 Cruising speed – approx. 28 knots. 

 Maximum speed – approx. 36 knots. 

 Consumption at cruising speed approx. 0.8L/NM. 

 Consumption at maximum speed approx. 1.1L/NM. 
 
Propulsion & Steering: 

 Volvo Penta Duoprop propeller in stainless steel. 

 Bowthruster (Sleipner). 

 Trim tabs with control unit. 

 Power assisted steering. 
 

ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS 
 
Voltage Systems: 

 12V & 220V electrical systems. 

 2 x USB and 12V outlets  (steering position and cabin). 
 
Battery Banks: 

 Service batteries, 12 V / 90 Ah (AGM Mastervolt battery) – 2022. 

 Start batteries, 12 V / 90 Ah (AGM Mastervolt battery). 

 Circuit breakers. 
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Battery Chargers: 

 220 V / 12 V / 25A (Mastervolt chargemaster). 
 
Shore Power: 

 230 V shore power with earth fault breaker and shore power cable. 
 
Other Electrical: 

 Navigation lights. 

 Electric Horn. 

 1 x Windscreen wiper. 
 

PLUMBING SYSTEMS 
 
Fresh Water & Water Heating System: 

 Pressurized hot and cold water, 12V pump. 

 15 L hot water (Isotemp Slim) – 2022. 
 
Bilge Pumps: 

 1 x Automatic bilge pump with float-switch.  

 1 x Manual bilge pump in cockpit. 
 

TANKAGE 
 
Fuel: 

 Fuel capacity of 200L. 
 
Fresh Water: 

 1 x 40L (plastic tank) – 2021. 
 
Grey/Blackwater Holding Tanks: 

 1 x 25 L holding tank. 

 Black water discharge outboard by gravity or from the deck.  

 Sinks discharge outboard. 
 

NAVIGATION EQUIPMENT 
 

 Compass with light. 

 Plotter 12” (Raymarine Hybridtouch) – 2023. 

 Navionics sea charts (Baltic Sea Large). 

 Depth/speed sounder. 
 

DOMESTIC EQUIPMENT 
 
Galley: 

 Gas stove, 1-burners with oven. 

 Gas bottle in separate stowage. 

 Fridge with freezer compartment (Isotherm 42L). 

 Single sink. 

 Mixer tap for hot/cold water. 

 Drawers for plates and cutlery. 
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Heads/Showers: 

 Separate head with manual toilet and wash basin. 
 
Heating & Ventilation: 

 Air heat exchanger with outlets in fore cabin and below windscreen (Defroster Isotherm 
10kw). 

 1 x ventilator in front cabin. 
 
Entertainment: 

 Stereo with Bluetooth – 2023. 

 Speakers in saloon and cockpit. 
 
Lighting: 

 Interior LED lighting. 

 Underwater LED lights. 

 Integrated lights in steps. 
 

ACCOMMODATION 
 
Summary of Accommodation: 

 2 berths in 1 cabin. 

 Handcrafted interior woodwork. 
 
Description of layout from forwards: 
 
Main Cabin: 

 2 x V-berths. 

 Stowage under berths and wardrobe. 

 Storage shelf above beds. 

 Ceiling lights and reading lights. 

 Openable skylight with mosquitonet and blind. 

 Sliding door (companionway) with mosquitonet. 

 Inspection hatches under sink and berths. 
 
Head: 

 1 x Toilet, manual (Jabco). 

 Wash basin (Duravit Starck). 

 Mix tap (Vola, stainless steel). 

 Cupboard under basin. 
 
Engine Room: 

 Engine. 

 Watertank. 

 Windlass. 

 Charger. 

 Circuit breakers. 

 Automatic firefighting system. 
 

DECK EQUIPMENT 
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Foredeck: 

 Sundeck in teak  

 Access to main cabin through skylight 

 Small stainless steel pulpit with lantern. 

 Cuchions for sundeck (same as for cabin berths). 
 
Cockpit / Aft Sun-Deck Area: 

 Seating for 6 people in 3 x leather sofas. 

 Adjustable steering wheel. 

 Control panel. 

 Storage under seating. 

 Foldable back seats 

 Sofa convertible to sunbed. 

 Fixed stainless-steel grab rails around boat. 

 Attachable dining table in wood. 

 Cooking facilities. 

 Shower at bathing platform (hot/cold water). 

 Bathing platform with bathing ladder in stern. 
 
General: 

 Good access and easy walk around possibilities. 

 Starboard fresh water filler. 

 Deckside discharge-point for holding tank. 

 Flag holder with stainless steel flag pole. 

 Curved stainless steel framed safety glass windscreen.  

 Access to foredeck through stairs on both sides. 
 
Anchoring & Mooring Equipment: 

 Electric windlass in stern with remote controll (12v Winchmatic MX-52). 

 Stern anchor (10kg anchor with 60m rope). 

 6 x stainless steel deck cleats (forward, mid and aft). 

 4 x Mooring lines. 

 6 x Fenders. 
 
Covers, Canvas & Cushions: 

 Sprayhood with attachable camper cannopy. 

 Tonneau cover (2 parts). 
 

SAFETY EQUIPMENT 
 

 First aid kit. 

 Toolkit. 
 
Fire-Fighting Equipment: 

 Fire extinguishers in cabin. 

 Auto fire equipment in engine compartment. 
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